

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATIO BID TABULATION

BID 20-59 – UNAUDITED

Polycarbonate Sheet Material (Annual Contract)

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: June 25, 2020 at 11:00 am

Note: _1__addendum was issued for this project.

BIDDERS	Doc signed (Y/N)	Ackw Add	L/ MWBE	Item #1a Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/4" Clear 20 each	Item #1b Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/4" Bronze 30 each	Item #1c Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/8" Clear 20 each	Item #1d Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/8" Bronze 10 each	Item #1e Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/4" Clear 10 each	Item #1f Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/4" Bronze 10 each	Item #1g Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/8" Clear 10each	Item #1h Polycarbonate Uncoated Lexan 9034 MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/8" Bronze 150 each
1. Piedmont Plastic 2410 Tech Center Parkway, Suite 150 Lawrenceville, GA 30043 Ph 770-939-5660 Fax 770-939-1616	Y	N	N	Model#252980 Min. order: 20 Unit Cost: \$129.33 Ext. Cost: \$2586.60	Model#253027 Min. Order: 10 Unit Cost: \$171.57 Ext. Cost: \$1715.70	Model#252953 Min. Order: 20 Unit Cost: \$78.68 Ext. Cost:\$1573.60	Model#253023 Min. Order: 10 Unit Cost: \$96.77 Ext. Cost: \$967.70	Model#252982 Min. Order: 20 Unit Cost:\$187.24 Ext. Cost: 1872.40	Model#Custom No Bid	Model#252955 Min. Order: 10 Unit Cost: \$97.19 Ext. Cost: \$971.90	Model#Custom No Bid

BIDDERS	Item #2a Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/4" Clear 10 each	Item #2b Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/4" Bronze 10 each	Item #2c Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/4" Bronze 30 each	Item #2d Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 4' x 8' x 1/8" Bronze 10 each	Item #2e Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/4" Clear 10 each	Item #2f Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/4" Bronze 10 each	Item #2g Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/8" Clear 10 each
1.	Model#19158 Min. Order: 10 Unit Cost: \$429.92 Ext. Cost: \$4299.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

BIDDERS	Item #2h Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/8" Bronze 10 each	Item 2i Polycarbonate Abrasion & UV resistant Lexan MR 10 or OptiMar (or approved equal) 5' x 8' x 1/8" Mirrored 10 each	Total Bid Cost
1.	NO BID	NO BID	\$13,987.10

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATIO BID TABULATION
BID 20-59 – UNAUDITED
Polycarbonate Sheet Material (Annual Contract)

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: June 25, 2020 at 11:00 am

Note: 1 addendum was issued for this project.

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Katrina L. Hagan, GCPA, Purchasing Agent CERTIFIED BY: Kathleen Watson-Scott, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

NUMBER OF ITBs Issued by District	<u>10</u>	TO LMWBE	<u> </u>	A	<u> </u>	W	<u> </u>	H	<u> </u>	S	<u> </u>	I	<u> </u>	L	<u> </u>	N	<u> </u>	M	<u> </u>	
NUMBER NOTIFIED BY GPR:	<u> </u>	TO LMWBE	<u> </u>	A	<u> </u>	AA	<u> </u>	NA	<u> </u>	H	<u> </u>	PI/A	<u> </u>	M	<u> </u>	NC	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	
NUMBER OF ITBS RECEIVED:	<u>1</u>	FROM LMWBE:	<u> </u>	A	<u> </u>	W	<u> </u>	H	<u> </u>	S	<u> </u>	I	<u> </u>	L	<u> </u>	N	<u>1</u>	<u> </u>	M	<u> </u>

KEY: DISTRICT MINORITY DESIGNATIONS:
A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W=WOMAN, H=HISPANIC, S=ASIAN AMERICAN, I=AMERICAN INDIAN, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL, M=MAJORITY

KEY: GPR MINORITY DESIGNATIONS:
A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, AA=ASIAN AMERICAN, NA=NATIVE AMERICAN, H=HISPANIC/LATINO, PI/A= PACIFIC ISLAND/AMERICAN, M =NON-MINORITY, NC=NOT CLASSIFIED